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MagicSchool AI is a platform designed for educators, featuring over 60 tools that enhance teaching

and streamline classroom management. It utilizes advanced AI technology to provide personalized

resources and interactive learning experiences, empowering teachers to focus on effective

instruction. Here are a few of my favorite tools we’ll be exploring tonight!

MagicSchools Tools

Tool Recommender

● Provides personalized tool
suggestions based on user
needs.

● Helps educators quickly find
the right tools for their specific
tasks.

● Simplifies the process of
navigating the MagicSchool
platform.

Rubric Generator
● Creates customizable rubrics

for various assignments and
assessments.

● Allows educators to define
criteria and performance
levels easily.

● Saves time in grading and
provides clear expectations
for students.

YouTube Video Question
Generator
● Generates questions based

on selected YouTube videos.
● Encourages critical thinking

and engagement with video
content.

● Useful for creating
assessments or discussion
prompts related to video
material.

MagicStudent Tools

Character Chatbot
● Engages students in

interactive learning through
simulated conversations with
characters.

● Customizable character
options to align with
curriculum themes.

● Enhances student
engagement and fosters
creative thinking.

Custom Chatbot
● Allows educators to create

tailored chatbots for specific
classroom needs.

● Can answer FAQs, provide
resources, or support student
learning.

● Flexible design to cater to
various subjects and grade
levels.

College Career Counselor
● Offers guidance on college

and career planning for
students.

● Provides information on
college applications,
scholarships, and career
paths.

● Helps students make
informed decisions about their
future education and careers.

https://www.magicschool.ai/

